

SHERIFF SALE LIST
TUESDAY, JULY 11, 2017 AT 1:30 P.M.
MAHONING COUNTY COMMISSIONERS' HEARING ROOM

CASE NO.	LOCATION	APPRAISED	MIN BID
1. 12CV940 CHEMICAL BANK VS TRACIE SAUCEMAN	945 BIRCH HILL DRIVE YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44509 53-161-0-049-000	\$55,000.00	RECALLED
2. 15CV1790 CITIMORTGAGE INC VS STEPHEN HURAJT	1630 WESTON YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44514 53-192-0-358-000	\$52,000.00	\$22,259.22 PLAINTIFF
3. 16CV2327 HOME SAVINGS & LOAN VS MARY MCCONAHY ET AL	37 POPLAR STREET YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44507 53-087-0-174-010	\$15,333.33	NO BID
4. 16CV1531 DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY VS MARGARET SILVERS ET AL	5412 SALEM UNITY LOT 2 & 3 SALEM, OH 44460 10-064-0-010-000, 10-064-0-011-000	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00 NO BID
5. 16CV2834 DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY VS REAL EST INVESTMENT CONNECTIONS	4308 EUCLID BLVD YCL#42582 YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44512 53-197-0-031-000		\$11,654.49 PLUS COSTS NO BID
6. 16CV2987 DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY VS MARC BAILY ET AL	526 CATALINA YCL 43700 YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44504 53-081-0-268-000		\$10,572.84 PLUS COSTS NO BID
7. 16CV2988 DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY VS LAWRENCE THOMPSON ET AL	145 W. INDIANA LOT#431 SEBRING, OH 44672 21-003-0-497-000		\$15,187.59 PLUS COSTS NO BID
8. 16CV2990 DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY VS EDDIE ROBINSON ET AL	52 W. FLORIDA YCL 38591 YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44507 53-123-0-206-000		\$6,688.78 PLUS COSTS NO BID
9. 16CV3084 DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY VS WILLIAM PEREGRIM ET AL	OLIVE AVE LOT 871 17742 OLIVE LOT 871 & 873 TRIUMP AVE LOT 851 BEACH LANE, CRAIG BEACH LOT 849, 848, 847, 846,845 LAKE MILTON, OH 44429		\$15,369.01 PLUS COSTS NO BID
10. 16CV3087 DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY VS JOHNEEN DVORACEK ET AL	ELLSWORTH RD GL1, TRACT 3 BERLIN CENTER, OH 44401 22-005-0-018.00		\$4,302.22 PLUS COSTS \$6,600.00 PLUS COSTS
JOSEPH & DEBORAH FARELLI			
11. 17CV102 DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY VS FAUSTINO CASTRO ET AL	85 SARANAC YCL 14622 YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44503 53-011-0-108-000		\$4,808.57 PLUS COSTS NO BID

**SHERIFF SALE LIST
TUESDAY, JULY 11, 2017 AT 1:30 P.M.
MAHONING COUNTY COMMISSIONERS' HEARING ROOM**

12. 17CV182	151 E. BOSTON YCL 39377	\$4,989.36
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY VS	YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44507	PLUS COSTS
DENNIS PYKARE ET AL	53-119-0-056-000	NO BID
13. 17CV182	627 IDORA AVE LOT 24470	\$3,301.80
DANIEL R YEMMA TREAS MAH CTY VS	YOUNGSTOWN, OH 44511	PLUS COSTS
DENNIS PYKARE ET AL	53-130-0-239-000	NO BID

NEXT SHERIFF SALE: TUESDAY, JULY 25, 2017

NEXT AVAILABLE SHERIFF SALE LIST: TUESDAY, JULY 18, 2017